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AGENDA
July 24, 2017

5:35 PM

Parish Council Meeting Room

 

 

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC: If you wish to address the Council, please complete the "Public Wishing to
Address the Council" form located on either end of the counter and give it to either the Chairman or the Council
Clerk prior to the beginning of the meeting. Individuals addressing the council should be respectful of others in
their choice of words and actions. Thank you.

ALL CELL PHONES, PAGERS AND ELECTRONIC DEVICES USED FOR COMMUNICATION
SHOULD BE SILENCED FOR THE DURATION OF THE MEETING

INVOCATION

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

CALL MEETING TO ORDER

ROLL CALL

1. RESOLUTION:  Awarding and authorizing the signing of the construction Contract for Parish Project No. 14-
ROAD-33, Hollywood Road Extension (Valhi Blvd. to LA 182), Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government,
Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, and authorizing the issuance of the Notice to Proceed.

2. RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 2 for the Construction Agreement
for Parish Project No. 14-DRA-44, Ellendale Levee Rehabilitation, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

3. Introducing an ordinance that will establish a "No Parking Zone" along both sides of Cypress Village Drive,



from Southdown Mandalay Road to Catherine Drive and calling a public hearing on August 9, 2017 at 6:30 p.m.
4. RESOLUTION:  Providing approval of Amendment No. 2 to the Engineering Agreement for Parish Project

No. 15-BLDG-62, Le Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.
5. RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 7 for the Construction Agreement for Parish

Project No. 97-PAV-21, State Project No. H.007351, Country Drive Widening Phase A, Terrebonne Parish,
Louisiana.

6. RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 4 for the Construction Agreement for Parish
Project No. 13-ROAD-37, Thompson Road Extension Phase II Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

7. RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 1 for the Construction Agreement for Parish
Project No. 15 -SEW-18, South WWTP Improvements Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

8. Adjourn



Category Number: 
Item Number:

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
INVOCATION

Item Summary:
INVOCATION



Category Number: 
Item Number:

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Item Summary:
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 



Category Number: 
Item Number: 1.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Construction Award - Hollywood Road Extension (Valhi to LA 182)

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Awarding and authorizing the signing of the construction Contract for Parish Project No.
14-ROAD-33, Hollywood Road Extension (Valhi Blvd. to LA 182), Terrebonne Parish Consolidated
Government, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, and authorizing the issuance of the Notice to Proceed.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/18/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/18/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/18/2017 Backup Material



 
 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 (REQUIRED FOR ALL SUBMISSIONS) 

PROJECT TITLE 
14-ROAD-33            Hollywood Road Extension (Valhi Blvd to LA Hwy 182) 

 

PROJECT SUMMARY (200 WORDS OR LESS) 
Construction of a new road 

 

PROJECT PURPOSE & BENEFITS (150 WORDS OR LESS) 
This resolution allows for the awarding of the bid to LA Contracting Enterprises, LLC   

 

TOTAL  EXPENDITURE 
$3,310,654.90 

AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE IS:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

ACTUAL ESTIMATED 

IS PROJECTALREADY BUDGETED:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

N/A NO YES 
 IF YES AMOUNT 

BUDGETED: 
$5,159,050.00 

 

COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED (CIRCLE ONE) 

PARISHWIDE 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 

 

Jeanne P. Bray       07/12/2017 

 

_______________________________________  ___________________________ 

                          Signature       Date 



OFFERED BY: 
SECONDED BY: 

 

R E S O L U T I O N 
 

A resolution awarding and authorizing the signing of the construction 
Contract for Parish Project No. 14-ROAD-33, Hollywood Road 
Extension (Valhi Blvd. to LA 182), Terrebonne Parish Consolidated 
Government, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, and authorizing the 
issuance of the Notice to Proceed. 

 
 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government did receive construction 
bids on Parish Project No. 14-ROAD-33, Hollywood Road Extension (Valhi Blvd. to LA 182), 
Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, and,  
 

WHEREAS, the lowest and best bid was that submitted by LA Contracting Enterprises, 
LLC, in the amount of $3,310,654.90, and 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated 
Government award the construction contract to LA Contracting Enterprises, LLC, in the amount 
of $3,310,654.90, and  
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the President of Terrebonne Parish Consolidated 
Government, be and is hereby authorized and empowered to sign a construction contract for and 
on behalf of the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government with LA Contracting Enterprises, 
LLC, upon receipt of the performance bond in the amount of the contract price, and            
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that upon receipt of required certificates of insurance 
evidencing coverage as provided in the project specifications and upon execution and recordation 
of all contract documents, that the Engineer is hereby authorized to issue the Notice to Proceed 
to the Contractor to commence construction of the project, and               
                                                                
 WHEREUPON the motion was put to a vote and the vote thereon was as follows: 
 
 YEAS:   
 NAYS: 
 NOT VOTING:  
 ABSENT  
            
And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 
2017. 

 

* * * * * * 
  

I, VENITA H. CHAUVIN, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, 
do hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by 
the Terrebonne Parish Council on ____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a 
quorum was present. 
 
 GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS 
__________ DAY OF _______________, 2017. 
        
       ______________________________ 
       VENITA H. CHAUVIN, CLERK 
        TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 





ENGINEERS' ESTIMATE $3,400,000.00 
LA Contracting Enterprise, LLC
Thibodaux, Louisiana $3,310,654.90 
License No. 34263
Byron E. Talbot Contractor
Thibodaux, Louisiana $3,528,754.90 
License No. 12198
Barriere Construction
Boutte, Louisiana $3,945,214.00 
License No. 6276
Command Construction
Metairie, Louisiana $3,950,000.00 
License No. 40038
Palmisano Construction
New Orleans, Louisiana $4,055,030.00 
License No. 44187 $4,056,850.00 
J.B. James Construction
Baton Rouge, Louisiana $4,585,601.50 
License No. 39462
Gray Construction Corporation
Morgan City, Louisiana No Bid
License No. 40312
The Three C's Properties, Inc.
St. Rose, Louisiana No Bid
License No. 38610
Shavers-Whittle Construction
Mandeville, Louisiana No Bid
License No. 36827
Barber Brothers Contracting
Baton Rouge, Louisiana  No Bid
License No. 46

TERREBONNE PARISH, LOUSIANA

BID TABULATION

VALHI BOULEVARD TO LA HWY. 182

BIDDER

PARISH PROJECT NO. 14-ROAD-33

Tuesday, July 11, 2017

HOLLYWOOD ROAD EXTENSION

2:00 p.m.

BASE BID              

441-094-PED



ITEM APPROX. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

BASE BID:
201-01 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $39,000.00 $39,000.00 $38,500.00 $38,500.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

202-01 1 L.S. Removal of Structures and Obstructions $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

202-02-c 580 S.Y. Removal of Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $20.00 $11,600.00 $11.00 $6,380.00 $8.20 $4,756.00 $12.00 $6,960.00 $10.00 $5,800.00 $6.00 $3,480.00 $5.00 $2,900.00

203-06-a 62.74 Sta Excavation and Linear Grading $3,000.00 $188,220.00 $1,800.00 $112,932.00 $2,205.00 $138,341.70 $2,000.00 $125,480.00 $1,800.00 $112,932.00 $1,450.00 $90,973.00 $5,000.00 $313,700.00

203-07 4,000 C.Y. Borrow Embankment (Hauled-In) (V.M.) $10.00 $40,000.00 $15.00 $60,000.00 $10.50 $42,000.00 $10.00 $40,000.00 $10.00 $40,000.00 $25.00 $100,000.00 $17.00 $68,000.00

204-02 100 Ea. Temporary Hay or Straw Bales $20.00 $2,000.00 $14.00 $1,400.00 $14.00 $1,400.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $5.00 $500.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $12.50 $1,250.00

204-06 12,400 Lft. Temporary Silt Fencing $2.00 $24,800.00 $1.75 $21,700.00 $2.00 $24,800.00 $2.00 $24,800.00 $2.00 $24,800.00 $1.25 $15,500.00 $1.75 $21,700.00

302-02 20,550 S.Y.
Class II Base Course (12" Thick) (Limestone) 
(Including Geotextile Fabric) $30.00 $616,500.00 $22.50 $462,375.00 $27.00 $554,850.00 $30.00 $616,500.00 $30.00 $616,500.00 $25.00 $513,750.00 $30.00 $616,500.00

401-02 1,250 C.Y.
Aggregate Surface course (Limestone) (Including 
Geotextile Fabric) $77.00 $96,250.00 $85.00 $106,250.00 $89.70 $112,125.00 $85.00 $106,250.00 $75.00 $93,750.00 $72.00 $90,000.00 $100.00 $125,000.00

601-01-c 1,222 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement (6" Thick) $45.00 $54,990.00 $47.00 $57,434.00 $60.00 $73,320.00 $60.00 $73,320.00 $50.00 $61,100.00 $58.50 $71,487.00 $50.00 $61,100.00

601-01-g 19,625 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement (11" Thick) $66.00 $1,295,250.00 $62.50 $1,226,562.50 $72.20 $1,416,925.00 $80.00 $1,570,000.00 $70.00 $1,373,750.00 $81.00 $1,589,625.00 $70.00 $1,373,750.00

701-03-f 64 Lft. Storm Drain Pipe (15" Dia.) (RCP) $25.00 $1,600.00 $47.00 $3,008.00 $27.00 $1,728.00 $60.00 $3,840.00 $75.00 $4,800.00 $62.00 $3,968.00 $130.00 $8,320.00

701-03-i 96 Lft. Storm Drain Pipe (24" Dia.) (RCP) $35.00 $3,360.00 $54.00 $5,184.00 $48.00 $4,608.00 $70.00 $6,720.00 $100.00 $9,600.00 $72.00 $6,912.00 $250.00 $24,000.00

701-03-o 356 Lft. Storm Drain Pipe (48" Dia.) (RCP) $90.00 $32,040.00 $115.00 $40,940.00 $120.00 $42,720.00 $160.00 $56,960.00 $175.00 $62,300.00 $140.00 $49,840.00 $300.00 $106,800.00

701-03-q 72 Lft. Storm Drain Pipe (60" Dia.) (RCP) $0.00 $220.00 $15,840.00 $177.00 $12,744.00 $200.00 $14,400.00 $250.00 $18,000.00 $200.00 $14,400.00 $350.00 $25,200.00

701-04-b 140 Lft. Storm Drain Arch (22" x 13") (RCPA) $50.00 $7,000.00 $54.00 $7,560.00 $35.50 $4,970.00 $65.00 $9,100.00 $75.00 $10,500.00 $60.00 $8,400.00 $100.00 $14,000.00

702-02 5 Ea. Manhole (R-CB-11) $5,000.00 $25,000.00 $3,800.00 $19,000.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $9,000.00 $45,000.00 $7,500.00 $37,500.00 $6,500.00 $32,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00

702-03 2 Ea. Catch Basins (CB-01) $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

704-01 645 Lft. Guard Rail $65.00 $41,925.00 $40.00 $25,800.00 $44.00 $28,380.00 $50.00 $32,250.00 $40.00 $25,800.00 $60.00 $38,700.00 $32.50 $20,962.50

707-01 6,060 Lft. 6" Wide Concrete Barrier Curb $6.00 $36,360.00 $4.30 $26,058.00 $6.00 $36,360.00 $10.00 $60,600.00 $3.00 $18,180.00 $6.00 $36,360.00 $4.00 $24,240.00

711-03 600 Ton Riprap (Class "C" or "D") $60.00 $36,000.00 $70.00 $42,000.00 $73.00 $43,800.00 $70.00 $42,000.00 $100.00 $60,000.00 $87.00 $52,200.00 $80.00 $48,000.00

711-04 200 S.Y. Geotextile Fabric under Riprap $5.00 $1,000.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $5.50 $1,100.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $3.00 $600.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $1.50 $300.00

713-01 1 L.S. Temporary Signs and Barricades $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

717-01 1 L.S. Seeding $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $990.00 $990.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $900.00 $900.00

718-01 1 L.S. Fertilizer $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $1,675.00 $1,675.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

723-02 6,500 C.Y.
Compacted Granular Material (VM) (Sub-Base 
Drain Pipe Backfill) $11.00 $71,500.00 $17.00 $110,500.00 $14.65 $95,225.00 $10.00 $65,000.00 $30.00 $195,000.00 $22.00 $143,000.00 $21.00 $136,500.00

Tuesday, July 11, 2017

Palmisano Construction JB James Construction, 
LLC

2:00 p.m.

Valhi Blvd. to LA Hwy. 182

BID BREAKDOWN

Parish Project No. 14-ROAD-33
Hollywood Road Extension

Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana

LA Contracting Enterprise, 
LLC

Byron E. Talbot Contractor, 
Inc.

Barriere Construction Co., 
LLC

Command Construction, 
LLCEngineer's Estimate

441-094-PED 1



ITEM APPROX. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

Palmisano Construction JB James Construction, 
LLC

LA Contracting Enterprise, 
LLC

Byron E. Talbot Contractor, 
Inc.

Barriere Construction Co., 
LLC

Command Construction, 
LLCEngineer's Estimate

726-01 895.2 C.Y.
Bedding Material (Limestone) (Net Section) 
(including Geotextile Fabric) $80.00 $71,616.00 $80.00 $71,616.00 $76.00 $68,035.20 $70.00 $62,664.00 $100.00 $89,520.00 $70.00 $62,664.00 $80.00 $71,616.00

727-01 1 L.S. Mobilization $151,592.50 $151,592.50 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $335,000.00 $335,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

729-01 152 S.F. Traffic Sign including Post and Assembly $35.00 $5,320.00 $60.00 $9,120.00 $33.00 $5,016.00 $30.00 $4,560.00 $60.00 $9,120.00 $32.00 $4,864.00 $8.00 $1,216.00

729-16 20 Ea. Object Marker Assembly $100.00 $2,000.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $95.00 $1,900.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $145.00 $2,900.00 $80.00 $1,600.00

731-02 200 Ea. Reflectorized Raised Pavement Markers $15.00 $3,000.00 $7.00 $1,400.00 $6.60 $1,320.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $6.50 $1,300.00 $100.00 $20,000.00

732-02-a 14,500 Lft. Plastic Pavement Striping (Solid Line) (4" Width) $0.80 $11,600.00 $0.65 $9,425.00 $6.60 $95,700.00 $0.60 $8,700.00 $0.50 $7,250.00 $0.50 $7,250.00 $0.15 $2,175.00

732-02-b 1,900 Lft. Plastic Pavement Striping (Solid Line) (8" Width) $5.00 $9,500.00 $1.30 $2,470.00 $1.35 $2,565.00 $1.20 $2,280.00 $1.00 $1,900.00 $3.00 $5,700.00 $2.00 $3,800.00

732-02-c 100 Lft. Plastic Pavement Striping (Solid Line) (12" Width) $12.00 $1,200.00 $6.50 $650.00 $2.20 $220.00 $6.00 $600.00 $7.00 $700.00 $3.00 $300.00 $5.00 $500.00

732-02-d 100 Lft. Plastic Pavement Striping (Solid Line) (24" Width) $22.00 $2,200.00 $13.00 $1,300.00 $4.40 $440.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $5.00 $500.00 $12.00 $1,200.00

732-03-a 1.20 Mile Plastic Pavement Striping (Broken Line) (4" Width) $1,600.00 $1,920.00 $1,400.00 $1,680.00 $1,325.00 $1,590.00 $1,250.00 $1,500.00 $1,200.00 $1,440.00 $1,150.00 $1,380.00 $3,200.00 $3,840.00

732-04 5 Ea.
Plastic Pavement Legends and Symbols (Arrows 
and Only) $500.00 $2,500.00 $285.00 $1,425.00 $220.00 $1,100.00 $275.00 $1,375.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $275.00 $1,375.00 $500.00 $2,500.00

740-01 1 L.S. Construction Layout $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

813-01 157.80 S.Y. Concrete Approach Slabs (12" Thick) $175.00 $27,615.00 $168.00 $26,510.40 $215.00 $33,927.00 $250.00 $39,450.00 $200.00 $31,560.00 $265.00 $41,817.00 $190.00 $29,982.00

S-001 475 Lft. Saw Cut $10.00 $4,750.00 $9.00 $4,275.00 $7.00 $3,325.00 $1.00 $475.00 $1.00 $475.00 $1.00 $475.00 $8.00 $3,800.00

S-002 170 Ea. Drilled Dowel Bars $15.00 $2,550.00 $28.00 $4,760.00 $34.50 $5,865.00 $25.00 $4,250.00 $20.00 $3,400.00 $1.00 $170.00 $20.00 $3,400.00

S-003 3,420 Lft. Pre-Cast Concrete Piles (16" Sq.) $50.00 $171,000.00 $57.00 $194,940.00 $58.00 $198,360.00 $54.00 $184,680.00 $60.00 $205,200.00 $61.00 $208,620.00 $60.00 $205,200.00

S-004 246 Lft. Pre-Cast Concrete Pile Caps $275.00 $67,650.00 $400.00 $98,400.00 $412.00 $101,352.00 $400.00 $98,400.00 $450.00 $110,700.00 $430.00 $105,780.00 $230.00 $56,580.00

S-005 250 S.Y. 12" Thick Pre-Cast Bridge Deck $500.00 $125,000.00 $340.00 $85,000.00 $330.00 $82,500.00 $320.00 $80,000.00 $550.00 $137,500.00 $562.00 $140,500.00 $490.00 $122,500.00

S-006 120 Lft. Pre-Cast Concrete Barrier $175.00 $21,000.00 $340.00 $40,800.00 $375.00 $45,000.00 $320.00 $38,400.00 $120.00 $14,400.00 $122.00 $14,640.00 $130.00 $15,600.00

GS1-a 144 Lft. 8" Gravity Sewer $35.00 $5,040.00 $30.00 $4,320.00 $48.00 $6,912.00 $90.00 $12,960.00 $150.00 $21,600.00 $110.00 $15,840.00 $125.00 $18,000.00

GS31-a 1 Ea. Standard Depth Manhole (4' Dia.) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00

W-1 150 Lft. 8" Dia. C-900 Water Main Pipe $45.00 $6,750.00 $26.00 $3,900.00 $30.00 $4,500.00 $70.00 $10,500.00 $75.00 $11,250.00 $50.00 $7,500.00 $65.00 $9,750.00

W-2 480 Lbs. Ductile Iron Fittings $10.00 $4,800.00 $8.00 $3,840.00 $9.50 $4,560.00 $3.00 $1,440.00 $1.00 $480.00 $6.00 $2,880.00 $9.00 $4,320.00

W-3 1 Ea. Tie-Into Existing 8" Dia. C-900 Water Main $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $2,750.00 $2,750.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

W-4 1 Ea. Flushing Apparatus $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $625.00 $625.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00

W-17 1 Ea. BAC-T Sampling Point Station $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $625.00 $625.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $550.00 $550.00 $600.00 $600.00

W-30 1 Ea. Relocate Existing Fire Hydrant (complete) $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

$3,423,998.50 $3,310,654.90 $3,528,754.90 $3,945,214.00 $3,950,000.00 $4,056,850.00 $4,585,601.50TOTAL AMOUNT BID - BASE BID PROPOSAL:

441-094-PED 2



Category Number: 
Item Number: 2.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Change Order No. 2 - Ellendale Levee Rehab

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 2 for the Construction Agreement for
Parish Project No. 14-DRA-44, Ellendale Levee Rehabilitation, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/18/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/18/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/18/2017 Backup Material



 

 

 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 (REQUIRED FOR ALL SUBMISSIONS) 

PROJECT TITLE 
14-DRA-44                                       Ellendale Levee Rehab 

 

PROJECT SUMMARY (200 WORDS OR LESS) 
Rehab of Ellendale Levee  

 

PROJECT PURPOSE & BENEFITS (150 WORDS OR LESS) 
Change Order No. 2 consists of increasing the amount of aggregate due to the condition of the 
haul road at the Valhi Blvd. This change order includes an increase of 27 calendar days due to 
adverse weather conditions in the months of May and June. 

 

TOTAL  EXPENDITURE 
$42,000.00 

AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE IS:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

ACTUAL ESTIMATED 

IS PROJECTALREADY BUDGETED:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

N/A NO YES 
 IF YES AMOUNT 

BUDGETED: 

$2,257,096.72 
 

 

COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED (CIRCLE ONE) 

PARISHWIDE 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 

 

Jeanne P. Bray       7/18/2017 

_______________________________________  ___________________________ 

                          Signature       Date 



OFFERED BY: 
SECONDED BY: 

R E S O L U T I O N 
 

A resolution authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 2 for the 
Construction Agreement for Parish Project No. 14-DRA-44, 
Ellendale Levee Rehabilitation, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana. 

 
 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government awarded the construction 
to  LA Contracting Enterprises, LLC, for Parish Project No. 14-DRA-44, Ellendale Levee 
Rehabilitation, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, and 
 
 WHEREAS, the haul road leading to the Bayou Country Sports Park (off Valhi Blvd) 
was adversely effected by the water level in the ditches and open field, and 

 

WHEREAS, the weight of the trucks on the saturated road caused the road to fall apart at 
a rapid pace, and 

 

WHEREAS, the Contractor requested additional riprap to build up the haul road, and 
 
WHEREAS, the Contractor requested Twenty-Seven (27) calendar days to the contract 

due to adverse weather for the months of May and June, and 
 

 WHEREAS, this change order will increase the overall contract price by Forty-Two 
Thousand Dollars and Zero Cents ($42,000.00), and 
 
 WHEREAS, Change Order No. 2 had been recommended by the Engineer, Providence 
Engineering and Design, LLC, for this project. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Council on 
behalf of the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, does hereby approve and authorize 
the execution by Terrebonne Parish President Gordon E. Dove of Change Order No. 2 to the 
construction agreement with LA Contracting Enterprises, LLC for Parish Project No. 14-DRA-
44, Ellendale Levee Rehabilitation, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, for an increase in the overall 
contract price of Forty-Two Thousand Dollars and Zero Cents ($42,000.00) and Twenty-Seven 
(27) calendar days, and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a certified copy of the resolution be forwarded to 
Engineer, Providence Engineering and Design, LLC 
 
THERE WAS RECORDED: 
 YEAS: 
 NAYS: 
 ABSENT & NOT VOTING: 
 
And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 
2017. 
 

* * * * * * 
 I, Venita H. Chauvin, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, do 
hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by the 
Terrebonne Parish Council on ____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a 
quorum was present. 
 
 GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS 
__________ DAY OF _______________, 2017.       
                           
         ______________________________ 
                   VENITA H. CHAUVIN, CLERK 
       TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 













Category Number: 
Item Number: 3.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Introduce ordinance, No Parking Cypress Village Dr.

Item Summary:
Introducing an ordinance that will establish a "No Parking Zone" along both sides of Cypress Village Drive,
from Southdown Mandalay Road to Catherine Drive and calling a public hearing on August 9, 2017 at 6:30
p.m.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Proposed ordinance 7/20/2017 Ordinance



OFFERED BY:     MR. A. MARMANDE 

SECONDED BY:    

 

ORDINANCE NO.  

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE PARISH CODE OF TERREBONNE PARISH, 

CHAPTER 18. MOTOR VEHICLES AND TRAFFIC, ARTICLE V. STOPPING, STANDING 

AND PARKING, DIVISION 2. PARISH, SECTION 18-223. NO PARKING ZONES, TO 

ESTABLISH A “NO PARKING ZONE” ALONG BOTH SIDES OF CYPRESS VILLAGE 

DRIVE, FROM SOUTHDOWN MANDALAY ROAD TO CATHERINE DRIVE; TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SAID SIGNS, AND TO ADDRESS OTHER 

MATTERS RELATIVE THERETO. 

 

SECTION I 

 

BE IT ORDAINED by the Terrebonne Parish Council, in regular session convened, 

acting pursuant to the authority invested in it by the Constitution and laws of the State of 

Louisiana, the Home Rule Charter for a Consolidated Government for Terrebonne Parish, and 

including, but not limited to, LSA R.S. 33:1368 and other statutes of the State of Louisiana, to 

amend the Parish Code of Terrebonne Parish, Chapter 18, Article V, Section 18-223 to create a 

No Parking Zone along both sides of Cypress Village Drive, from Southdown Mandalay Road to 

Catherine Drive and to provide for the installation of said signs. 

 

SECTION II 

 

If any word, clause, phrase, section or other portion of this ordinance shall be declared 

null, void, invalid, illegal, or unconstitutional, the remaining words, clauses, phrases, sections or 

other portions of this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect, the provisions of this section 

hereby being declared to be severable. 

 

SECTION III 

 

Any ordinance or part thereof in conflict herewith is hereby repealed. 

 

SECTION IV 

 

This ordinance shall become effective upon approval by the Parish President or as 

otherwise provided in Section 2-13 (b) of the Home Rule Charter for Consolidated Government 

for Terrebonne Parish, whichever occurs sooner. 

 



Category Number: 
Item Number: 4.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Amendment No. 2 for Le Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Providing approval of Amendment No. 2 to the Engineering Agreement for Parish Project
No. 15-BLDG-62, Le Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/18/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/18/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/18/2017 Backup Material



 
 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 (REQUIRED FOR ALL SUBMISSIONS) 

PROJECT TITLE 
Project No. 15-BLDG-62                                                                       Le Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building 

 

PROJECT SUMMARY (200 WORDS OR LESS) 
To renovate the Le Petite Theatre de Terrebonne building  

 

PROJECT PURPOSE & BENEFITS (150 WORDS OR LESS) 
The purpose of this amendment is to cover costs associated with the redesign of two ADA 
compliant access ramps. 

 

TOTAL  EXPENDITURE 
 Increase of $2,500.00 

AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE IS:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

ACTUAL ESTIMATED 

IS PROJECTALREADY BUDGETED:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

N/A NO YES 
 IF YES AMOUNT 

BUDGETED: 
$ 989,625.00 

 

COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED (CIRCLE ONE) 

PARISHWIDE 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 

 

Jeanne P. Bray       07/19/2017 

_______________________________________  ___________________________ 

                          Signature       Date 



OFFERED BY:    
SECONDED BY:     

R E S O L U T I O N 
 

A resolution providing approval of Amendment No. 2 to the 
Engineering Agreement for  Parish Project No. 15-BLDG-62, Le Petit 
Theatre de Terrebonne Building, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.  

 
 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government entered into a Engineering 
Agreement dated February 11, 2016, with Duplantis Design Group, PC for the Project entitled 
Parish Project No. 15-BLDG-62, Le Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building, and 
  

WHEREAS, the Engineering Agreement between OWNER and ENGINEER only has 
provisions for certain limitations for Basic and Additional Services, and 
 

WHEREAS, it is necessary to re-design two ADA compliant access ramps, and     
 
 WHEREAS, this above work will increase the additional services section of the contract 
by an additional $2,500.00. 
 

WHEREAS, the firm of Duplantis Design Group, PC, has been asked to oversee these 
activities under the Additional Services section of the Engineering Agreement for this project, and  
 

WHEREAS, the TPCG is desirous of having these services continued so that there is a 
need to increase in the upset limit, and 

  

 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Council, on behalf 
of the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, does hereby approve this Amendment No.2 
to the Engineering Agreement for a total increase of $2,500.00 and authorizes Parish President, 
Gordon E. Dove, to execute this Amendment No. 2 to the Engineering Agreement for the Le Petit 
Theatre de Terrebonne Building, Parish Project No. 15-BLDG-62, with Duplantis Design Group, 
PC, and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a certified copy of the resolution be forwarded to the 
Engineer, Duplantis Design Group, PC. 
 
THERE WAS RECORDED: 
   
 YEAS:  
 NAYS: 
 NOT VOTING:  
 ABSENT  
 
And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 2017. 

 

* * * * * * 

 

 I, VENITA CHAUVIN, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, do 
hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by the 
Terrebonne Parish Council on ____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a 
quorum was present. 
 
 GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS 
__________ DAY OF _______________, 2017. 
        
       ______________________________ 
        VENITA CHAUVIN, CLERK 
        TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 
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AMENDMENT NO. 2 
TO 

ENGINEERING AGREEMENT 

THIS AMENDMENT NO. 2, hereafter sometimes referred to as "AGREEMENT", made and 
entered into this              day of              , 2017; 

BY AND BETWEEN: 

TERREBONNE PARISH CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT, (TPCG), a political 
subdivision of the State of Louisiana, represented herein by its duly authorized President, Gordon E. Dove 
(hereafter sometimes referred to as "OWNER"), and 

DUPLANTIS DESIGN GROUP, PC., represented herein by Kyle D. Domangue, AIA, duly 
authorized representative of the firm (hereafter sometimes referred to as "ENGINEER"): 

is a revision pursuant to 5.1.1 (Basic Services) and 5.1.2 (Additional Services) to the  ENGINEERING 
AGREEMENT dated February 11, 2016, and was amended by Amendment No. 1, for professional 
engineering services between the OWNER and ENGINEER. 

WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government did enter into an original 
engineering contract dated February 11, 2016, and was amended by Amendment No. 1, to the entitled Le 
Petit Theatre de Terrebonne Building, identified as Parish Project No. 15-BLDG-62, and 

WHEREAS, the Engineering Agreement between OWNER and ENGINEER provides for certain 
limitations for Basic Services and specific Additional Services, and 

WHEREAS, it is necessary to re-design two ADA compliant access ramps, and 

WHEREAS, this above work will increase the additional services section of the contract by an 
additional $2,500.00. 

WHEREAS, the firm of Duplantis Design Group, PC, has been asked to perform these activities 
under the Basic and Additional Services section of the Engineering Agreement for this project, and 

WHEREAS, the TPCG is desirous of having these services continued so that there is a need for 
additional funds to be added to the contract for an increase in the upset limit for these services, and  

NOW THEREFORE, be it understood and agreed by the parties hereto amend the contract as 
follows: 

Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.1, reads as follows: 

5.1.1 For Basic Services.  OWNER shall pay ENGINEER for Basic Services rendered 
under Section 1 (as amended and supplemented by Exhibit "A", “Further 
Description of Basic Engineering Services and Related Matters”) as follows: 
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Architectural Fee = Fee Percentage(Construction Cost(1975 BCI/2015 BCI)(2015 CPI/1975 CPI) 

Fee Percentage = (46.10/(Log(Construction Cost(1975 BCI/2015 BCI))))*1.20) 
1975 2015 

BCI 1306 5388 
CPI 53.8 236.7 

The fee for basic services based on a percentage of the construction cost will have 
a maximum limitation of 110% of the ENGINEER's Opinion of Probable 
Construction Cost submitted with the Final Design Documents in accordance 
with Section 1.4.3 of this contract. The fee for basic services based on a 
percentage of the construction cost will have a minimum limitation of 90% of the 
ENGINEER's Opinion of Probable Construction Cost submitted with the Final 
Design Documents in accordance with Section 1.4.3 of this contract.  

Amend Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.2, to read as follows: 

5.1.2 For Additional Services.  OWNER shall pay ENGINEER for Additional Services 
rendered under Section 2 as follows: 

5.1.2.1 General.  For Additional Services rendered under Paragraphs 2.1.1 
through 2.1.17, inclusive (except services covered by Paragraph 2.1.7 
and services as a consultant or witness under 2.1.16), on the basis of 
Exhibit "D", “DUPLANTIS DESIGN GROUP RATE SHEET - 
2012".  At this time, the following additional services are anticipated 
and the Estimated Costs shown below are recommended for budgetary 
considerations. 

CURRENT  RECOMMENDATION     NEW 
DESCRIPTION  LIMIT    INCREASE      LIMIT 
2.1.2   Surveying/ Existing Conditions $  4,000.00 $   0.00    $  4,000.00 
2.1.3   Design Changes  $       .00 $(+)2,500.00    $  2,500.00 
2.1.17 Haz-Mat Abatement Design   $  9,500.00 $      0.00    $  9,500.00 
2.1.17 Foundation X-Ray   $     0.00 $   0.00    $      0.00 

Total $ 13,500.00 $   2,500.00    $ 16,000.00 

Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.2.2, reads as follows: 

5.1.2.2 Special Consultants.  For services and reimbursable expenses 
incurred for coordination of special consultants employed by 
ENGINEER pursuant to Paragraph 2.1.1 or 2.1.17, on the basis of 
Exhibit "D".  Services and reimbursable expenses of special 
consultants will be approved by ENGINEER, but shall be paid 
directly by OWNER.  At this time, the following special consultants 
are anticipated, and the Limitation of Costs shown below are 
recommended for budgetary considerations: Not at this time 
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Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.2.4, reads as follows: 

5.1.2.4 Resident Project Services.  For resident services during construction 
furnished under Paragraph 2.2.1, on the basis of Exhibit "D" for 
services rendered by principals and employees assigned to field 
offices in connection with resident project representation with a 
Limitation of Cost of $0.00 

Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.3, reads as follows: 

5.1.3 For Reimbursable Expenses.  In addition to payments provided for in 
Paragraphs 05.1.1 and 5.1.2, OWNER shall pay ENGINEER the actual costs of 
all Reimbursable Expenses incurred in connection with all Basic and Additional 
Services with a Limitation of Cost of $5,000.00. 

Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.4, reads as follows: 

5.1.4 As used in this Paragraph 5.1, the term "Construction Cost" will have the 
meaning assigned to it in Paragraph 6.1; the term "Reimbursable Expenses" will 
have the meaning assigned to it in Paragraph 5.4 and the term "Limitation of 
Cost" will have the meaning assigned to it in Paragraph 5.5. 

Amend Section 5, Paragraph 5.1.5, to read as follows: 

5.1.5 The estimated cost of Paragraphs 5.1.2, 5.1.3, and 5.1.4 shall have combined 
Limitations of Cost in the amount of $21,000.00, which shall not be exceeded 
without the issuance of a formal change order authorized by the Terrebonne 
Parish Consolidated Government through its duly authorized President. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have affixed their legal hands on this    day of 
__________, 2017. 

        OWNER:   ARCHITECT: 
TERREBONNE PARISH CONSOLIDATED DUPLANTIS DESIGN GROUP, PC 

    GOVERNMENT 

BY:___________________________ BY:      _____ 
     Gordon E. Dove,       Kyle D. Domangue, AIA 
     President        Senior Project Architect 

WITNESSES: WITNESSES: 

 ______ 

  _____  _
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Category Number: 
Item Number: 5.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Change Order No. 7 for Country Drive Widening Phase A

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 7 for the Construction Agreement for
Parish Project No. 97-PAV-21, State Project No. H.007351, Country Drive Widening Phase A, Terrebonne
Parish, Louisiana.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/19/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/19/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/19/2017 Backup Material



 
 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 (REQUIRED FOR ALL SUBMISSIONS) 

PROJECT TITLE 
97-PAV-21                                                                                                             Country Drive Widening Phase A 

 

PROJECT SUMMARY (200 WORDS OR LESS) 
Widening of Country Drive  

 

PROJECT PURPOSE & BENEFITS (150 WORDS OR LESS) 
The purpose of this change order is to adjust quantities due to the relocation of drain lines and 
heavy rains. This Change Order No. 7 will decrease contract price from $4,520,339.56 to 
$4,506,971.56 (a decrease of $13,368.00) with no increase in construction time. 

 

TOTAL  EXPENDITURE 
Decrease of $13,368.00 

AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE IS:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

ACTUAL ESTIMATED 

IS PROJECTALREADY BUDGETED:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

N/A NO YES 
 IF YES AMOUNT 

BUDGETED: 
$4,506,971.56 

 

COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED (CIRCLE ONE) 

PARISHWIDE 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 

 

Joan E. Schexnayder       7/19/2017 

_______________________________________  ___________________________ 

                          Signature       Date 



OFFERED BY: 
SECONDED BY: 

R E S O L U T I O N 
 
 

A resolution authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 7 for 
the Construction Agreement for Parish Project No. 97-PAV-21, 
State Project No. H.007351, Country Drive Widening Phase A, 
Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana. 

 
 
 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government entered into a contract 
with Huey P. Stockstill, LLC, for Parish Project No. 97-PAV-21, State Project No. H.007351, 
Country Drive Widening Phase A, Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, Terrebonne 
Parish, Louisiana, and 
 
 WHEREAS, TPCG is desirous of constructing the widening of Country Drive, and 

 

WHEREAS, changes to drain line placement changed the quantities needed of certain 
items, and 
 
 WHEREAS, recent heavy rainy weather require additional material to maintain 
residents’ driveways, and 

 

 WHEREAS, this change order will decrease the overall contract price by Thirteen 
Thousand, Three Hundred Sixty-Eight Dollars and Zero Cents ($13,368.00) with no increase in 
Contract Time, and 

 
WHEREAS, this Change Order No. 7 has been recommended by the Engineer, Meyer 

Engineers, Ltd., for this project. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Council on 
behalf of the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, does hereby approve and authorize 
the execution of Change Order No. 7 by Terrebonne Parish President Gordon E. Dove for the 
construction agreement with Huey P. Stockstill, LLC for Parish Project No. 97-PAV-21, State 
Project No. H.007351, Country Drive Widening Phase A, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, for a 
decrease of Thirteen Thousand, Three Hundred Sixty-Eight Dollars and Zero Cents ($13,368.00) 
with no increase in Contract Time, and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a certified copy of the resolution be forwarded to 
Engineer, Meyer Engineers, Ltd. 
 
THERE WAS RECORDED: 
 YEAS: 
 NAYS: 
 ABSENT & NOT VOTING: 
 
And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 2017. 

* * * * * * 
 I, Venita H. Chauvin, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, do hereby certify that the 
foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by the Terrebonne Parish Council on 
____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
 
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS __________ DAY OF 
_______________, 2017.                      
            
    ______________________________ 
                  VENITA H. CHAUVIN, CLERK 
       TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 



 
 
 
Richard C. Meyer, P.E. 
  President 
David H. Dupré, P.E. 
  Vice President 
Mark A. Schutt, P.E. 
Ann M. Theriot, P.E. 
James J. Papia, N.C.A.R.B.,A.I.A. 
Eric M. Colwart, P.E. 
Kenneth J. Belou, P.E. 
 
 
 

 

 
 

P.O. Box 763 / Metairie, Louisiana 70004 
E-mail:  meyer@meyer-e-l.com 

Fax: 504-887-5056 
 

 
 
 
Charles E. Meyer, P.E. 
  Executive Vice President 
Jitendra C. Shah, P.E. 
  Vice President 
Matthew J. Falati, P.E. 
Elena G. Anderson, IIDA 
   LA Reg. ID #1353 

 
 
 
 
 

 

4937 Hearst Street • Suite B • Metairie • Louisiana • 70001 • (504) 885-9892 
 

       July 19, 2017 
 
Ms. Joan E. Schexnayder, P.E. – Staff Engineer 
Terrebonne Parish C.G. - Engineering Division  
P. O. Box 2768 
Houma, LA 70361 
 
Re: Country Drive Widening Phase A 
 State Project No. H.007351 
 A/E Project No. 20-1541 
 
Dear Ms. Schexnayder, 
 

Enclosed are three (3) originals of Change Order No. 7 in the Deductive amount of 
($13,368.00) for the above referenced project.  

 
See Attachment No. 1 for description and justification. 
 

 We recommend approval of Change Order No. 7 in the Deductive amount of 
($13,368.00). The Contract duration of 376 working days is unaffected by this Change Order. 
  
 Please execute and return all originals to our office for further processing. Once fully 
executed, we will return one (1) original to your office for your file. 
 
       Sincerely, 
 
       Meyer Engineers, Ltd. 
 
                                                                           
                                                                           Richard C. Meyer 
 
 
 
Enclosures 
 

mailto:meyer@meyer-e-l.com




Attachment No. 1 

Change Order No. 7 

Country Drive Widening Phase A 

A/E 20-1541  

 

1.) Scope of Change: Eliminate need for Nonplastic Embankment – 1,267 CY at $100.00 per CY                  
                                                                    
                                                                                                                         DEDUCT: ($126,700.00) 

 

2.) Additional Class II Base Course – 9,984 SY at $10.50 per SY 

                                                                                                                                               ADD: $104,832.00 

 

 

3.)  Additional Traffic Maintenance Aggregate – 500 CY at $17.00 
 
                                                                                                                                    ADD: $8,500.00 
 
 
 
                                                                                                            TOTAL DEDUCT: ($13,368.00) 

Justification: 

1) Numerous drain lines were installed nearer the outer limit of the right of way to avoid existing 
conflicts throughout the project limits. As a result of such relocation the bedding material 
required for drain line installation encompassed much of the area where Nonplastic 
embankment was needed thereby eliminating the need for Nonplastic embankment. 

2) Elimination of the quantity noted in Justification No. 1 above still left a 4” depth to be filled 
under the Class II Base Course under the widening location for a total of 12” Class II Base Course 
in lieu of 8”. Since the additional 4” amounts to an increase of 50% of plan thickness Contractor 
agreed to place the additional thickness at 50% of the existing contract unit price of $21.00 per 
SY or $10.50 per SY. 

3) Due to recent heavy rain activities Traffic Maintenance Aggregate placed in resident’s driveway 
have settled warranting the need for additional aggregate to continue services accessibility to 
said driveways. 

Time Extension: 

No additional time for this change is required. 



Category Number: 
Item Number: 6.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Change Order No. 4 for Thompson Road Extension Phase II

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 4 for the Construction Agreement for
Parish Project No. 13-ROAD-37, Thompson Road Extension Phase II Project, Terrebonne Parish,
Louisiana.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/19/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/19/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/19/2017 Backup Material



 
 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 (REQUIRED FOR ALL SUBMISSIONS) 

PROJECT TITLE 
Project No. 13-ROAD-37                                                                                Thompson Road Extension Phase II 

 

PROJECT SUMMARY (200 WORDS OR LESS) 
The purpose of this project is the construction of Thompson Road from Hwy. 57 to Hwy 56 on 
the southern side of Woodlawn Ranch Road.  

 

PROJECT PURPOSE & BENEFITS (150 WORDS OR LESS) 
The purpose of this Change Order No. 4 is to increase the Construction Contract from 
$7,312,734.90 to $7,442,997.67 (increase of $130,262.77) in order to cover costs associated with 
various quantity adjustments, additional mill and overlay work on Hwy 57, and adjustment of 
stop bars on Thompson Road at Hwy 56. This Change Order No. 4 will not change Construction 
Contract time 

 

TOTAL  EXPENDITURE 
Increase of $130,262.77 

AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE IS:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

ACTUAL ESTIMATED 

IS PROJECTALREADY BUDGETED:  (CIRCLE ONE) 

N/A NO YES 
 IF YES AMOUNT 

BUDGETED: 
$ 7,442,997.67 

 

COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED (CIRCLE ONE) 

PARISHWIDE 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 

 

Jeanne P. Bray       7/19/2017 

_______________________________________  ___________________________ 

                          Signature       Date 



OFFERED BY:    
SECONDED BY:     

R E S O L U T I O N 
 

A resolution authorizing the execution of  Change Order No. 4 for the 
Construction Agreement  for Parish Project No. 13-ROAD-37, Thompson 
Road Extension Phase II Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.  

 
 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government entered into a Construction 
Agreement dated  November 10, 2015, with Barriere Construction Co., LLC., for the Project entitled 
Parish Project No. 13-ROAD-37, Thompson Road Extension Phase II Project, and 
  
 WHEREAS, this change order is required to cover costs associated with various quantity 
adjustments, additional mill and overlay work on Hwy 57, and adjustment of stop bars on Thompson Road 
at Hwy 56, and 
 

WHEREAS, this change order has been approved by the Louisiana Office of Facility Planning and 
Control, and 
 
 WHEREAS, this Change Order No. 4 has been recommended by the ENGINEER for this project, 
T. Baker Smith, LLC.,  

  

 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Council, on behalf of the 
Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, does hereby approve and authorize Parish President, Gordon 
E. Dove, to execute this Change Order No. 4 to the Construction Agreement for the Thompson Road 
Extension Phase II Project, Parish Project No. 13-ROAD-37, with Barriere Construction Co., LLC., for an 
increase in contract amount by One Hundred Thirty Thousand Two Hundred Sixty-Two Dollars and 
Seventy-Seven Cents  ($130,262.77) with no increase in construction time, and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a certified copy of the resolution be forwarded to the 
Engineer, T. Baker Smith, LLC. 
 
THERE WAS RECORDED: 
   
 YEAS:  
 NAYS: 
 NOT VOTING:  
 ABSENT  
 
And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 2017. 
 

* * * * * * 

 

 I, VENITA H. CHAUVIN, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by the Terrebonne Parish 
Council on ____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
 GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS __________ 
DAY OF _______________, 2017. 
        
       ______________________________ 
        VENITA H. CHAUVIN, CLERK 
        TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 



PROJECT:

OWNER

OWNER'S Contract No.

ENGINEER:

You are directed to make the following changes in the Contract Documents
Description:

Original Contract Times:
Substantial Completion
Ready for final Payment:

Substantial Completion
Ready for final Payment:

Substantial Completion
Ready for final Payment:

RECOMMENDED: APPROVED: ACCEPTED:

By:___________________________ By:___________________________
Engineer (Authorized Signature) Owner (Authorized Signature) Contractor (Authorized Signature)

Date:______________ Date:______________

Phase II - Roadway Paving

TPCG Project No. 13-ROAD-37

Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government

CONTRACTOR: Barriere Construction Co., LLC T. Baker Smith, LLC

File No. 1494032, Book No. 2785, Pg No. 686

Change Order No. Four (4) is necessary to add additional work to the project scope of work to Mill and Overlay a section of LA Hwy 57 South 
of the intersection of Thompson Road.  This work is being included in the scope of work due to safety concerns and conditions of the existing 
highway surface at the transition adjacent to the new turning lane onto Thompson Road.  In addition, the striping/stop bars are being adjusted 
on Thompson Road and LA Hwy 56 due to site clearance issues due to agricultural grow of sugar cane obstructing view on LA Hwy 56.

DATE OF ISSUANCE: 19-Jul-17

days or date

$130,262.77 0

April 7, 2017

days

Contract Price with all approved Change Orders

Net Increase (decrease) of this Change Order No. 4 Net Increase (decrease) of this Change Order

Contract Time with approved Change Orders

Date:______________

$7,442,997.67 45 Days
days or date

By:___________________________

April 7, 2017
$7,312,734.90 45 Days

Contract Price prior to this Change Order No. 4 Contract Time prior to this Change Order

$26,878.85 72
days

January 25, 2017
$7,285,856.05 45 Days

days or date

Net Changes from previous Change Order Nos. 1 , 2& 3 Net Changes from previous Change Orders 

420 Days

Reason for Change Order:  See Plan Change No. Four (4) for additional information. 

Original Contract Price:

Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana

LA 56 to LA 57

Change In Contract Price: Change In Contract Time:

CHANGE ORDER
NO. FOUR (4)

Thompson Road Extension

EFFECTIVE DATE:
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Engineer T. Baker Smith, LLC

Reference Thompson Road
LA 57 to LA 56
Phase II - Roadway Paving
Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana
TPCG Project No. 13-ROAD-37

Description:

Reason for Plan Change:  

ORIGINAL REVISED
Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

202-02-02020 Removal of Asphalt Pavement SY 937.18 10.00$                 $               9,371.80 1043.47  $              10.00  $         10,434.70 
202-02-06100 Removal of Concrete Walks and Drives SY 217.62 12.00$                 $               2,611.44 283  $              12.00  $           3,396.00 
204-05-00100 Temporary Sediment Check Dams (Hay) EA 62 110.00$               $               6,820.00 0  $            110.00 $                      -   
204-06-00100 Temporary Silt Fencing LF 30099.19 1.75$                   $             52,673.58 28596  $                1.75  $         50,043.00 
302-02-05100 Class II Base Course (10" Thick) SY 69715.6 25.00$                 $        1,742,890.00 69517.23  $              25.00  $    1,737,930.75 
502-01-00100 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete Ton 19005.45 90.50$                 $        1,719,993.23 20679.94  $              90.50  $    1,871,534.57 
509-01-00100 Cold Planning Asphaltic Cement (2") SY 0 -$                     $                          -   1067  $              20.00  $         21,340.00 
601-01-00100 Portland Cement Concrete Pavement (8" Thick) SY 536.12 70.00$                 $             37,528.40 567  $              70.00  $         39,690.00 
701-03-01080 Storm Drain Pipe (36" RCP) LF 337 80.00$                 $             26,960.00 360  $              80.00  $         28,800.00 

701-04-02080
Storm Drain Pipe Arch (Outfall)

(36" Equivalent CMPA)
LF 10 140.00$               $               1,400.00 25  $            140.00  $           3,500.00 

701-12-01060 Corrugated Metal Pipe (Extension)(24") LF 85 70.00$                 $               5,950.00 0  $              70.00 $                      -   
701-12-01060 A Storm Drain Pipe (24" RPCA) LF 144 118.10$               $             17,006.40 176  $            118.10  $         20,785.60 

701-13-01080
Corrugated Metal Pipe Arch 
(Extension)(36" Equivalent)

LF 15 110.00$               $               1,650.00 0  $            110.00 $                      -   

702-03-00100 Catch Basins (CB-01) EA 3 3,000.00$            $               9,000.00 4  $         3,000.00  $         12,000.00 
706-02-00200 Concrete Drive (8" Thick) SY 164.33 57.00$                 $               9,366.81 185  $              57.00  $         10,545.00 
711-01-04000 Riprap (55lb, 18" Thick) SY 1155.56 135.00$               $           156,000.60 778.89  $            135.00  $       105,150.15 
711-04-00100 Geotextile Fabric SY 1772.67 7.50$                   $             13,295.03 1660.67  $                7.50  $         12,455.03 
712-04-00100 Flexible Revetment SY 1772.67 140.00$               $           248,173.80 1660.67  $            140.00  $       232,493.80 
717-01-00100 Seeding LB 792.03 11.00$                 $               8,712.33 600  $              11.00  $           6,600.00 
718-01-00100 Fertilizer LB 26401 0.75$                   $             19,800.75 20000  $                0.75  $         15,000.00 
726-01-00100 Bedding Material CY 175.85 70.00$                 $             12,309.50 175.85  $              70.00  $         12,309.50 

727-01-00100-A Re-Mobilization LS 0 -$                     $                          -   1  $       25,100.00  $         25,100.00 
729-01-00102 Sign (Type A) (Furnish and Install) SF 104 11.00$                 $               1,144.00 88  $              11.00  $              968.00 
729-21-00100 U-Channel Post EA 11 210.00$               $               2,310.00 12  $            210.00  $           2,520.00 
731-02-00100 Reflectorized Raised Pavement Markers EA 1034 8.00$                   $               8,272.00 874  $                8.00  $           6,992.00 
732-01-01000 Plastic Pavement Striping (4" Width plastic 90 Mil) LF 39808.33 0.85$                   $             33,837.08 46505  $                0.85  $         39,529.25 

732-01-01040
Plastic Pavement Striping (8" Width) (Thermoplastic 90 

Mil)
LF 363.08 3.25$                   $               1,180.01 739  $                3.25  $           2,401.75 

732-01-02080
Plastic Pavement Striping (24" Width) (Thermoplastic 90 

Mil)
LF 712.66 15.00$                 $             10,689.90 794  $              15.00  $         11,910.00 

732-03-02000
Plastic Pvmt Strip 

(Brkn Line) (4" W) (Thermo 90 Mil)
Mile 2.55 1,600.00$            $               4,080.00 2.597  $         1,600.00  $           4,155.20 

732-03-02030
Plastic Pavement Striping (Dotted Line)(8" width)

(2' Length)(Thermoplastic 90 Mil)
Mile 0.09 11,000.00$          $                  990.00 0.063  $       11,000.00  $              693.00 

732-04-01020
Plastic Pavement Legends and Symbols 

(Arrow-Straight)
EA 3 335.00$               $               1,005.00 4  $            335.00  $           1,340.00 

732-04-01100 Plastic Pvmt Legends & Symbols (Arrow - RT. Turn) EA 3 335.00$               $               1,005.00 1  $            335.00  $              335.00 
804-10-00100 Reloading Test Piles EA 1 7,000.00$            $               7,000.00 0  $         7,000.00 $                      -   
804-11-00100 Redriving Test Piles EA 1 3,800.00$            $               3,800.00 0  $         3,800.00 $                      -   
804-12-00100 Loading Permanent Piles EA 1 2,700.00$            $               2,700.00 0  $         2,700.00 $                      -   
806-01-00100 Deformed Reinforcing Steel LB 76961 1.35$                   $           103,897.35 77072  $                1.35  $       104,047.20 
NS-200-00020 Cleaning Existing Ditches LF 23000 1.75$                   $             40,250.00 22102  $                1.75  $         38,678.50 
NS-600-00220 Saw Cutting Portland Cement Concrete LF 462 4.50$                   $               2,079.00 1080  $                4.50  $           4,860.00 

NS-MSC-00300(a) Rebuild Cofferdam (Bayou Chauvin) EA 1 7,000.00$            $               7,000.00 0  $         7,000.00 $                      -   
S-003 LA 57 Undercut & Backfill LS 0  $                      -    $                          -   1  $       13,210.98  $         13,210.98 
S-004 LA 56 Undercut & Backfill LS 0  $                      -    $                          -   1  $       12,266.80  $         12,266.80 

 $                          -   $                      -   
TOTALS 4,332,753.00$        4,463,015.78$     

Additional Contract Days Requested 0 Revised AMOUNT OF OVER RUN 130,262.77$        
APPROVED BY:  
Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government

/S/ /S/ Date:

RECOMMENDED:

/S/

Plan Change No.   Four (4)
Date: July 19, 2017

Plan Change No. Four (4) is necessary to adjust existing pay items (both increases and decreases) to reflect installed quantities and to add additional pay 
items for new work.  

Plan Change No. Four (4) is necessary to add additional work to the project scope of work to Mill and Overlay a section of LA Hwy 57 South of the 
intersection of Thompson Road.  This work is being included in the scope of work due to safety concerns and conditions of the existing highway surface 
at the transition adjacent to the new turning lane onto Thompson Road.  In addition, the striping/stop bars are being adjusted on Thompson Road and LA 
Hwy 56 due to site clearance issues due to agricultural grow of sugar cane obstructing view on LA Hwy 56.

Item No. Item Unit Bid Quantity
Revised 
Quantity

Authorized Signature

REQUESTED BY:
Barriere Construction Company, LLC

Authorized Signature Gordon Dove, Parish President

T. Baker Smith, LLC
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Category Number: 
Item Number: 7.

Monday, July 24, 2017

Item Title:
Change Order 1 for South WWTP Improvements

Item Summary:
RESOLUTION:  Authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 1 for the Construction Agreement for
Parish Project No. 15 -SEW-18, South WWTP Improvements Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type
Executive Summary 7/20/2017 Executive Summary
Resolution 7/20/2017 Resolution
Backup Material 7/20/2017 Backup Material





OFFERED BY: 

SECONDED BY: 

R E S O L U T I O N 
 

A resolution authorizing the execution of Change Order No. 1 for the 

Construction Agreement for Parish Project No. 15 -SEW-18, South 

WWTP Improvements Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana. 

  

 WHEREAS, the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government entered into a contract 

dated March  6, 2017 with Synagro South, LLC., Recordation Number 1528972, for Parish 

Project No. 15-SEW-18, South WWTP Improvements Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, 

and 

 

 WHEREAS, this change order has been recommended to remove additional dry tonnage 

in lieu of credit for scales, and 

  

WHEREAS, this change order will increase the contract time 8 calendar days, and 

 

 WHEREAS, this Change Order No. 1 has been recommended by the Engineer, 

GreenPoint Engineering, LLC, for this project. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Terrebonne Parish Council on 

behalf of the Terrebonne Parish Consolidated Government, does hereby approve and authorize 

the execution by Terrebonne Parish President Gordon E. Dove of Change Order No. 1 to the 

construction agreement with Synagro South, LLC. for Parish Project No. 15-SEW-18, South 

WWTP Improvements Project, Terrebonne Parish, Louisiana, for an increase of eight (8) 

calendar days to the contract, and 

 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a certified copy of the resolution be forwarded to 

Engineer, GreenPoint Engineering, LLC. 

 

THERE WAS RECORDED: 

 YEAS: 

 NAYS: 

 ABSENT & NOT VOTING: 

 

And the Chairman declared the resolution adopted on this ___________ day of __________, 

2017. 

* * * * * * 
I, Venita H. Chauvin, Clerk of the Terrebonne Parish Council, Houma, Louisiana, do hereby 

certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the RESOLUTION adopted by the 

Terrebonne Parish Council on ____________________________, 2017, at which meeting a 

quorum was present. 

 

 

GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS __________  

 

DAY OF _______________, 2017.         

                         

         ______________________________ 

                   VENITA H. CHAUVIN, CLERK 

       TERREBONNE PARISH COUNCIL 
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